Robert Handoko

From: "Andrey Tkachenko" <tkachenko@alnas.ru>

To: ""Robert Handoko™ <ptbertindock@bdg.centrin.net.id>
Cc: "Teddy M. Budiman" <tmbudiman@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2006 2:03 PM

Subject: RE: Claim from PERTAMINA

Dear Mr. Robert,
I can’t accept this claim as you must pay us for the equipment supplied by us in 2004 and not for controllers.

As to controller. [ accept to reduce the price of your debt for the price of controllers (5200 USD) if you want
to give them me back.

I already made too many concessions to you. My management was not very happy that I split debt between
you and Robin. They think that you must pay all the debt but I persuaded them to agree with splitting debt
between you and Robin. And I didn’t ask you any penalties for the delay of payment. If you take the credit in
the bank for such long period you will pay a lot of money for the interest rate.

Please don’t delay with payment in August as it can make additional problems for me and for you.
Best Regards / C ypaxenuem

Andrey Tkachenko / Annpeit Tkauenko
Chief of Export Department / Hauansnux Biopo B3C
ALNAS / OAO "AJIHAC"

Phone / Tenedon + 7 (495) 3318277
Fax / ®axe +7(495) 3318244
Mob. / Mo6. +7(916) 2941206
e-mail: tkachenko@alnas.ru
http://www.alnas.ru

From: Robert Handoko [mailto: ptbertindock@bdg.centrin.net.id]
Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2006 10:38 AM

To: tkachenko@alnas.ru

Cc: Teddy M. Budiman

Subject: Re: Claim from PERTAMINA

Dear Andrey,

I hope the claimed of USD 42,000 on ST 39 by PERTAMINA can be our responsible (fifty-fifty). |
want you to agree with me on this situation.

For your info, the total debt of approximately USD 75,000 (includes ST 39) that is claimed by
PERTAMINA on BERTINDO. This responsibility will divide on two ways as
PT.BERTINDO USD 54,000
ALNAS USD 21,000 (50% of the total debt on ST39)

USD 75,000

This problem is really important in fact we have to clear it first. If you agree, I will take the claimed
from PERTAMINA. If this problem is cleared, PERTAMINA will pay the rest of our money. Then, I will pay
on August,

Once again thank you very much for your cooperation. Please confirm soon.

Best Regards,
Robert Handoko



